ST, feATeeT U<er, 09 SI-a), 2026 /19 WY, 1947 9999

Keeping in view the public interest, the RVNL should ensure to re-locate these schemes in their
original condition. The Rail Vikas Nigam will take immediate steps for the repair of existing schemes and
re-construction afresh.

The Land Acquisition Officer (Railway) Bilaspur should ensure before disbursement of
Rehabilitation and Resettlement benefits that if any family’s name included in two villages in that condition
the benefit may be given in one place after verifying the eligibility of R&R scheme The benefit to any
undeserved family should not be given wrongly.

fafer favmT

RMclT—2, 5 @RI, 2026

T T TA.IMR—S1.(6)—22 / 2025—alol —fRATaA US¥ & ISUUTl ° 9IRA & Gl &
IITST 200 B A Uacd WAl BT TART B gU A= Uel Gamd! ol (|eie) fagae,
2025 (2025 Bl faerge WGl 19) Bl fai 31—12—2025 PI QT BR AT & ToAT IS
348 & @US (3) B N, fA9gd & ST ure &1 o9, fRArae uer § ySidd &= & oy
WiApad &R AT 71 3 SWiad fA8g® & 94 2026 & ARRH G=AH 1 & wY H ol
UIEgd UTe |ied JIeyd (S—7Toic) fBArae Uael ¥ Ul fdhar ST & |

M ET,

BETEIRT / —
(Sfo fad® Q)
g fafer ol vd Ay afa ([@f) |

2026 P IAfATIH TRTDH 1
fRorae wew e o7 () srfarfeE, 2025

gRT BT HH

fereg A4 |

&RT 2 BT I |

gRT 4 BT TN |

gRT 5 BT AN |

gRT 5— T AN |
gRT 7—& BT TN |
gRT 9 T FIE |

gRT 31 BT GNE |

9. URT 32 BT FIEH |

10. ©RT 33 BT AL |

11. ©RT 38 BT HNEH |

12. ©RT 39 BT AL |

© N Ok wDND =



10000 IoTuF, fedrereT UQer, 09 STHEN), 2026 /19 U, 1947

13. ©RT 40 BT HINE |
14. ORT 41 BT e |
15. ©RT 60 DT AL |
16. ©IRT 64 BT HLMEH |
17. ©RT 76 BT AN |
18. ©IRT 99 BT e |
19. ORT 115 BT FiCRATIA |
20. RT 120 &1 G |
21. €RT 121 T BT XA |
22, ERT 122 BT HE |
23. €T 133 BT G |
24, SRT 134 HT G |
25. €RT 142 HT G |
26. ©RT 144 BT AN |
27. ORI 145 &1 G |
28. €RT 151 BT YfaRATOA |
29. €T 152 HT FINYA |
30. €IRT 155 T FME |
31. YRT 158—C &I FIMEH |
32, ©RT 160 T AL |
33. YRT 160—H BT FINE |
34. ©IRT 161 BT TN |
35. YRT 167 BT HMEH |
36. ©RT 169 T AL |
37. ©RT 172 BT FNEH |
38. €IRT 186 T e |
39. ©RT 190 T HIMEH |
40. W—saﬂmﬁwml

2026 BT JARATIH F=ITDH 1
fRArae URe demRl ST ([eneH) s, 2025
(AT ISTUTE FEIGd gIRT ARG 31 fSHWR, 2025 BT JeIRIgANd)

fRHTae Uer vl o7 IIfSfIH, 1994, (1994 &7 AfAFTIH AwHIB 4) BT AR FEeH
PR B [Ty e |

YR TR & (Bgckd 94 # fRurad uewr fagmq wwr gr1 fa=falRad wa & g
sfRfafa en—

1. dfe Am——s9 e o dea 9E RAed gew ErR e (EE)
3T, 2025 2|

2. ORI 2 BT FIEA—RAEd U Garael o SrffaH, 1994 (™Y 99 s90@
TR “Hol ATIH B8 TAT B ) B GRT 2 H—



ST, feATeeT U<er, 09 SI-a), 2026 /19 WY, 1947 10001

(@) @vs (22) H, "gvs Ufhar wfedl, 1973 @1 ORI 2" ], fog &R &l & H W)
AU ARTRS GRET A2dl, 2023 (2023 HT 46) BT URT 2" W, 8 AR 3fd /I ML |

(@) @ve (35)H, "WRAI TUS Wfedl, 1860 &I ORI 21" e, fag iR 3Pl & WM W)
RATT =TT GfdT, 2023 (2023 HT 45) BT ORT 2 (28)" ¥ex, forg IR 3fd W G |

3. HURT 4 & GO JRATH & aRT 4, & IU-GRT (3) & gvan Fr=faRad
SraRenfa  fdhar SIrgem, sreria—

"(4) afe BIE wafaq—
(@) for=iY ferataes ATTael @ GA), YeoT a1 gfy;

@) fo=ft vfafe & o afae AmmEen § Afdfaa a1 S9H saiia fag o @
TqFE H,

fORad ®U & PIS HUF AT VAT TN HRAT & O AT B &R s Ao 89 &1
T al SO S 2 A7 fAvarg § a1 e 9 89 &1 S fazarg T8 8, a1 98OI
155 & STJAR ToSd fam SITQam |” |

4, ORI 5 BT \AEA.——Td AAFRTH B aRT 5 H—

(@) SI—oRT (1) #,

(@) facha wge H—
(31) "SUgET" TTes b Uz ‘AT Fawre” wres iU fhy S

(@M N ek @R IR 98 YRl & WM W AN e iR faRy S8
Te& AT W SIUI; 3R

(i) JI wRgd H, AN AR D WM W AR WY& AT ST,

(@) SU-grT (3) H—
(i) TR ¥R & uErq AT ARy’ ves SrTRnfud fhy SITe; 3iR

(i) "gw & 4 H ‘1" T @ WM W v T @ Qi iR aowErq
feraforRaa siaenfaa far Sro, srerig——

"R I8 3R & SRR & SARTHahdT & YA o AR e A aw
& FHARIE SS9 AR a9y 9% Torgfd & ova d wIffig 81 @
ST 17 |

5. YRI5 @ &I WURM.—HA JIMAFTH & gRT 5-@ & IU-—eRT (1) § "8 Ad Pl
P IR TG B IAH W “BYIN B Ugol I(AIR BI* Ieg I SITG |

6. HRT 7—-F BT WIMEA.——Hd ARAFRH B gRT 7-F & -1 (3) # " g &
R R " g 3@ S $iR acqeanq frefoRaa sa=enfud far Sirgem, sieria—

IR UM UERIE BT Y SU—UTH G DI qodl H 99T i & w9 Ao
ST fhar SITUAT T e Sae 986 H |1 of Fo | |




10002 IoTuF, fedrereT UQer, 09 STHEN), 2026 /19 U, 1947

7. ORT 9 BT AR~ JRAFIH BT gRT 9 B IU—GRT (1) H, "AdADH BE 3R
IRl HT AN fHar QT |

8. HRT 31 &1 HYNYA.——H AMRFTIH B aRT 31 B IU—oRT (1) #, "Ivs ufthan G,
1973" ¥R, g 3R 3Pl & WM W "R ANRS GRE Wfadl, 2023" (2023 & 46) I,
forg iR i 3@ e |

9. YT 32 PT HANEA.— IMMAFITH & IRT 32 B IU—4RT (2) H—
(@) "gve ufehar WA, 1973 & ORT 125" H ¥eal, g 3R 3Pl & WM R 4RI

AR YRET AR, 2023 (2023 BT 46) DI GRT 144" ¥eq, I AR 3fb I S,
<IN

(@) “gi= A U R] B R W T ok TIU” 6@ & ST |

10. ©RT 5 BT FARH——A AMRDTIH & gRT 33 ¥, "Th Al 39 9 JARS" I<’l &
WM TR “Th IR BUT Th" Ieq I STV |

11. ©RT 38 BT HIMEA.— AT &) aRT 38 H—

(@) @re (@) ¥ "WRAG qUe Wfdl, 1860 HI URT 379" ¥l g 3R 3fdl &
WM W IRA™I < GEdl, 2023 (2023 BT 46) B &RT 303 (2)" ¥, ==,
PSP IR FH W WG, 3R

@) @ve (1) # “gve Yfhar \fdr, 1973 @ 9RT 109 AT 110" ¥<l, fa= iR 3!
@ WM R ARAY ANRS GReT Afedl, 2023 (2023 HT 46) B &RT 128 AT
129" 1, fueg iR 3fd T WG |

12. RT 39 & FEA.— ARAFTTA @1 g_7T 39 # "] Al TR &l & ©H R “Th
BOIR S ITeq I SO |

13. RT 40 HT HARM——HeT AT o a1 40 ¥, “Tve ufthar Afkar, 1973 @ ary
202" @I, g &R 3/l & WM W IR ANREG T AiEdl, 2023 (2023 HT 46) B &RT
225" e, foeg 3R 3fd I U |

14, TRT 41 BT A~ ARTTH B &Ry 41 H -

(@) SU-GRT (1) H, "3I EOR " &l & ©F R "I 8ok 0" I W T,
3R

(@) SU—ERT (2) #, "Uig gOIR ¥UY’ &l & WM W TR TR SUY" g W SIS |

15. GRT 60 BT HIAEH——H ARTTH T gRT 60 & IT—GRT (4) H “IRAT AMed
e, 1872 <Us ufehar AfRdr, 1973" weki, forg @R &fdi & UM W "IRA A1eg eI,
2023, (2023 BT 47) WRAG ARG FReT Afedl, 2023 (2023 &7 46)" =, g R 3fF @
ST |

16. ©IRT 64 BT HLMEA.——Ho AMRFRH B aRT 64 H,

(@) SI—RT (2) ¥, “gvs ufehar Afdr, 1973 & 9RT 7" ¥egl, g @R &l & WH W)

o1
"ARA ANTRS GRET HEdT, 2023 & €RT 7° Teq, &8 3R 3P I WG, 3R



ST, feATeeT U<er, 09 SI-a), 2026 /19 WY, 1947 10003

(@) SU—uRT (5) H, "Ivs ufehar AR, 1973 & A 33" eal, g 3R 3fd & WA
TR IRAR ARTRS GRET Hiadl, 2023 (2023 T 46) & 3TN 34" ¥eE, g R 3id
W S |

17. ORT 76 & FAEA——Td JRTH P g_T 76 H, "RAT US Hidl, 1860 B &RI
75 A1 TUS Ufthar WARdT, 1973 &I &RT 356 AT 360" i, gl 3R &fdi & WM W "R
=g WfEd, 2023 (2023 BT 45) DI GRT 13 T YR ANTRE GReT GiEdl, 2023 (2023 BT 46) Bl
RT 394 AT 401" ¥eq, foeg IR i I TG |

18. ©RT 99 T HEA.—l ARTIT BT IRT 99 H—

(@) SU-o_T (5) ®, ‘1" forg & v W fore <@m S &R dergarq fAforRad
AR febar Y, srerie—

Re] I Bl e PR & oY yErgd Al MY ¥ Ied dwg dand
AR & AT & sREREN Mo S, e foy SRiicr srgHeT a9 |
IHDI I N d3F | AU foam e |; iR

N O\ N

@) Su—urT (6) H, “I" g & WM W faw @ S iR qawErq EfaRad
R ST fbar SITe, srerfd—

IR Ia9 BT Ha B & forg Rorar uRug Ay 9 3369 dwg e aRkvg &
AT & SWEREA Fhrell SeHl, e foy drifaR IgAed 99T 4 IS gRd
NI d3& ¥ SIfduTa favam Sgem | |

19. ORI 115 & YU JRFTH @1 aRT 115 & RIF R frefaRaa <@n
SITUHTT, 3T€'Jﬁ?[:——

“115. BT B aFAL——(1) UART H1 | dFRd gRT (AT @fdd | grar
I A 5 aR, O <), foxmEn, o a1 {60 3T IBH @ Il DI agel!
Bg U Afdd 3l Al SR $Rd FHKT Jdeddh HaH oI |

2) g Tvs A fSaHr), tard AffT ok ™ darad @) 9r9d v afddal
1 Ul I ¥ © fd G Afed 9elid eH & AR dorde’ Bl URd
B |

(3) g T IRGN ARHRI T gRYg @ aad U Afdadl =9 WAl 368
3T T D A Afed AT WBH B @R heldex Dl UG ST |

(4) UEA ERT SM@ET &1 TS IHH YOG & JHRT & w9 H Helaek gRI agel D
ST FH:

IR N9g WRBR MY gRT BHME UQel Yo A1, 1953 (1954 &7 6)
& A BT 3T TGN BT FHofder B WAfdTAT BT YANT B & oIy Fge
PR DI ||

20. URT 120 &1 HARH——Hd ARAFRH @ arT 120 # SU-uRT @) & YA
fr=feRaa arazenfud fdhar Sirgem, siefia—



10004

o1, feATael U<el, 09 STFaNI, 2026 /19 UIY, 1947

21.

“(4) afs @13 Ygga, sg FaEE AN gRT Mafed dRied SINT &1 @ 99Enq
Wﬁmmw—wmmm%mwﬁ@ﬂ%ﬁﬁaﬁ
Sl ® @1 ggerqadi Tfed VAT Uarad @ I[afd g & 3T Ul @ AT—¥TeT
A |

GRT 121 7T P SORAUA.—T STAFTA B gR- 121-F & TN reriad

SRR febar STQm,  srerie—

(®)

1217 fated Y @ ol Wiud H %hd I8d W FREAL—afe wiered AfEerl
HT T B S 5 BIg @fd -

39 A & el mufdd Y R Wy & WMok Maies &g & o |iod |
A% B AT ® ; AT

(@) s gRT AT 17 o fAfkd urey & oI aR T8l € ; ok

()

22,

I foly BIg BT Tqd T TEIGRY 8l &, dl 98 Fared kel & Ml &I
e fafas Ifrery & Iorm, S IS § USRI ARy gRT U gl B
gagd & oy go S SfR URIReN 84 & o7y Mo, H Ses & YBRME @l
I & I 9 @) oy 7 FRfET aiffa e <R faifoa saiffers & fafes
BT I GINT BT

R DI VAT TR UH 37QY & FHeH I O 3F @ 3faey & 9ok dvsel
IR DI AU HR FHT 3R A HT 3 i W 1" |

€RT 122 BT [~ SMAFTIH B aRT 122 H—
(@) ST &arRT (1) H,—
(i) @@(@@) H, "R BT Q¥ UM AT B, Y&l & 9gEnq Sid ddb fd Ul

aORIG I UH TeR0 & dR ¥ UTiedhd TRl &l feepd far war & 9
qig a§ @) BTy BT AR A & AT 8 W AR by ST,

(i) @ve (@) # "MR™ BT IANNIE SEXT AT & &I & Ugarq oid b SAD]
qvfafg & U 9 @ Qrafr &1 st F B AT B Y vk Iraefud fhy
ST

(iii) @ve (3) #, "gve ufhar wfear, 1973 @1 &RT 110" ¥ee, fag @R 3idl & I
R ARAR ARTRG {RET Afgdl, 2023" (2023 &7 46) s, g iR ik W
ST

(iv) @S (@) & TR 1 A foraT T
Y GRT (1) & gean AfalRad iaxenfud fear Sire, serid—

‘(1—®) I D13 Y4 YSIRIGRI, darad & & o9 a1 = a1 o= ww=ufy e a8
U UePR R8I & DI BI, ARG, S0, gwUdlod og &Nl Uil Sl 8 a1 Si
AR & AT b Tl d 8R IUAT & HRYT ITD gRT 8 © ofd db b SAD
W@@ﬁﬁ%ﬁﬁmﬁmmﬂﬁﬁwﬁ UORIT &1 Pl USTEBRT T
S & forg frfEa 8, R




IO, fRATEd Uew, 09 SIFAN), 2026 /19 U, 1947 10005
(M) SU-GRT (2) % ‘(1) Brod AR AH & YA "IN U ORI (15)" Bod, MR AR
3f 3fa:xemfud fbw I |

23. YR 133 BT HeMEA.——qol IRATH o a7 133 & Y gRT (1) H§ Fewe” os &
T AT S GRT UMAehd DIg A BRI Tea JfewTud fby ST |

24. YR 134 BT FIEA.——TA FAAFTIA B IRT 134 H—

(@) ST GgRT (2) & @ve (B) # e gk veai & uganq A1 Qe o Sid:-werfud

fpu ST,

(@) SU URT ()& @re (B) #, "ol uRvg” o<l & ggara a1 Fe9d a1 I WRaR”
I IidRenfid fy Mo |

25. YR 142 BT FIEA.——TA AAFTIH B gRT 142 H -

(@) SU gRT (1) § UGN, ek IR Fg & U ‘SRiad | U YgEe & SR
U4 YRIReRI” o] Sa-IRmiud fhy g |

(@) U uRT (2) & uzar FefoRad siaenfia fhar s, st —

@) T Wefda fAafia, wfaer, e Jaudrfl, emseard I s Aror emenRa
HHATRAT SN BfTs IFIAT, I AR TER—IH, dhAIdh! AeRH, GTard Ua 3T=1
THE BIHGI, ST gardl 9em dargay ol faurr gRr R e ™ € @
StRefd W RuiRa fear oo, afes o S 39U U Sdal & 9t dRa H
IHE YA € AT U Hiedl BT Uo7 d deavdl 9 a1 (de & R T8 avd
=

26. GRT 144 P HAEH——TA AT BT gRT 144 & IU aRT (3) & @Woe (@) H,
"gos Ufehar ARl 1973 @ A 7 & IUSH” Uek], G, U, R SR Dl B WM W
AR ANTRSG GReTl Hidl, 2023 (2023 HT 46) & IR 7 & IUGHl” eq, &g AR 3fd I
ST |

27. €T 145 BT LA —H ARAFTIH BT 9R_T 145 ¥,—

(@) ST—eRT (1) H,
(i) @vs (b) & wIF W F=fRad @1 S, did—

“(@) S Q0SS IRMT AT 3F¥AT & oy dies a7 4 1f¥p @1 @y & forg
FfRe ¥ =T B A e fIeg IRG | Afedn, 2023 & =AW 4, 7, 9,
10, 13 3R SEUTT 5 BT ORT 63, 64, 65, 66, 67, 68, 69, 70, 71, 80, 88 I 94 TP,
99 3R JLATT 6 BT &RT 103, 104, 107, 108, 109, 141, 146 JLATT 17 3R FeATA
18 @1 GRT 310(2), (3), 311, 312, 316(4), (5) 318(4), 326(B), 331(6) 3R (8) TH,
IR T AT TSy IMEHRI AfRAIH, 2011 & AT 6 DI ORI 39 A 59 OB
I AP TR T ITIdl BT GRETUT AWTIH, 2012 W YRR AR
fSfaH, 1988 & e I W AEHT AR SN ufdsor & fHaror, Rt
TAT ITADT b T H IMfdh AIR THA 3R RAfdet MfABPRI & FReT07 FFaely
THT 9 el o= Y & arefi= 5=l <ifiss sriarfzal # omRv farfrd
feby T &




10006 IoTuF, fedrereT UQer, 09 STHEN), 2026 /19 U, 1947

W 39 s b FH B ueiter & FEfdd w1 & fou R o3 &
T HROT AR AIfeT TR B+ B MaeIhdT el art R feifaa faar
T BIE N geEIfer), e faeg fodl smRifds e d§ Ry farfud
fru v & wew =mTery & <ifaw vty 9o faefad @ m:

Wy I8 SR & fefl oMmiffas TRy a1 o=y dRUr ¥ deE o ¥ s
Y qh f2Rd H e @ g6 efdd fbu Te geiEeny o1 e g @R
fear ST Al SrIor S ¥ERe g1 AR @ ARG | B8 A & iR
[eTH AT H JARMY UF YR A8l (bl Sl 8;°; 31R

(i) SU-GRT (1) & WP BT AT HAT ST |
(@) SU-GRT 2—%) & WIF W) =ferRad @1 SIgm, siiq—

"(2—F) SU—URT (1) & ES (1) I SU-GRT (2) & (&N ¥l USSR HI d9 qTd
fyeifea =& foar Som o9 d@ 6 99, garRerfd, R = a1 uRfis S A
fFRieror a7 oRar Wi RUIC &1 9fd & A1 SR IRl AlfCH IR FRe S9 gAars
BT AR 9 < fear S|

() SU—URT (3) #, “SU—aRT (1) AT (2)" i, gl AR fd & WM W "SU-GRT (1)
BT GUS (1) JU GRT (2)" ¥Te’, g 3R 3fdh @M A, AR

(5) SU—eRT (3) & Uwenq ffRad ardRenfia fapar S, srerfd—
“(3—) W AT ¥, AR URT 146 B T 7T BE A b AR T L B 8,

ST &R dTel JAfTBRT Fafed IraadRl Bl foflRad H HRUT URgd d AR g89d
faRed B8 a9 @ folv T IR faarR fear S aa |

(3—w) afe <0 fraifaa ol & &R 9 Y & gaR o= & sRIEa A &
foru B ®, a1 fociad J1eer ©e 39 &1 GHId & d1g YE gl fhdr S 3R S
AR fRiRd 3afd & Hax TehardT Siig & 7T ST g |

(3—1) B GRT B SU-URT (3) & AN fAciad & UfTHERT BT M RT 146 &
FfF g BI 99 db J91fad 8] BRI ofd ddb b a1 fshy et F8) Sirar
RN

(®) SWIRT (4) # o', & WH W g W@ e iR aowanq Frefoiaa
faenfua fear e, srerid—

R IS UAFdl & FaifEa uefEetRAal & 39 JMr 96 Fefdd e fear sy fb
Eﬁﬁﬁaﬁﬁqﬂ@mﬁa‘raﬁﬁwl GAId B 4% g @ forg sruferd worgfc gl
B B B, A T WRAR AT VAT W R) orr fafed fear v A& amm |
P
Q@f
T

RreiRert wr, ool affa @ s wfed @l @1 ve wfifr wfod @ e, o
feifed eIyl ur qifom Aoty <ifdd <8v d darad &7 oikeal &1 9T,
Al BT Ut 3R Brat &1 fAded el ||

28. ©RT 151 BT YARUA——ERT 120 HT FEH—T ARRH P aRT 151 & WA
R fer=faRad @ S, srerid—



ST, feATeeT U<er, 09 SI-a), 2026 /19 WY, 1947 10007

“151. P Hew, USIOeGR) IT Ade gRT <fder #§ fRd vl &1 & forw
IRT—ITE T BT B A AT USHTGRT AT Addh, GarId & AT IT SHD
ERT 7 SFPT MR A I T8 Ffder a1 fbu v HA e & gogera: ar veerd:
B3 Jufaas ofw a1 B, 94 gu ARfd axar & a1 9@ IR § I8 FHS SITeIT
5 SO R =gy fRdT, 2023 (2023 BT 45) BT GRT 202 B S URTET fhar 2 |

WEIHERIL—SH &RT & GO @ ol "Gad @ Hadh” & =id Iavd affaferd 8 Sl
TERd & M e RS9 UisAe & S d & f[IaR 9 oy 91 d9ed § HaRd
21|

29, HIRT 152 T WM. SMAFTH @1 gRT 152 #, "WRAG <€ Afddr, 1860
gRT 341" eq), foregl 3R 3fdl & I WR, "R =TI Afedl, 2023 (2023 6T 45) BT &RT 126
2)" v, forg, 3R i /g S |

30. YR 155 & HINEA.——Tol SMAFTH @1 aRT 156 H fJerd= Suaw &I (1) & w9 A
Agifed fobar Siewm SfR, deagerq FefaRad srd-<enfud fdar s, srerfd—

‘() afs &g afp, foxdt vfafe & foft fatee Armaet & afmfoa o SOd safsia
fru 99 & g § foRaa w©u § IS HAF IT TIYON HRAl & ol 7y § iR fas
e B & A1 @1 S I © 1 fava § w1 e I 89 &1 S fawa q8 7 ar
I SN W, S UM BIR BUY T 81 AT, GI0Sd [hal SITgm |” |

31. YRT 158—T BT HIEA.—— AAFTIA B gRT 158—T H—

(@) W@ H AdeE @& A" veal & gvarq 3R UET & faq” wes sraenfua fag
\_rﬂ'Q?f; 3ﬁ?

(@) SU—YRT (1) ¥, “Ada &89 #* &l & g 3R A@VET & fGq” oeg sr-werfud
fey g |

32. HIRT 160 T HIMEH.——H AT & gRT 160 &I SULRT (1) & < #, " | g
S I " e @1 ST 3R S9e yvEn fEfaiad Sfaenfud fhar Sre, srerd—

IR Hael VW aafth W I fated emgw & w9 # fgie @ foav far fea
ST, S @ A7 9 WRGR H Ju—U AT $01—1 & Ug R 99 a9 db BRI
frar & iR S9 fafem (Mafeml) @& At &7 orgva &1 a1 S9a favg @IS
Aaddr a1 R AFern dfdd = 8rn

R I8 3R P FRYRP B A gd Faedn MR FEo—um A1 gred far S ||

33. GRT 160—% P HIMEF—— IMATH B IRT 160—F #, 5T TWHR' &K Slal
PEl 3T & @ W R e fFafa afder” oeg I o |

34. URT 161 & HIARA——T AT & gRT 161 & WS (iii) H, "AMGa” q& B

W WR "HUsAYd ¥sg T SITYIT |

35. YRT 167 T HeMEE.——qal AR @7 g_T 167 B IU—aRT (2) H, "“IRAT AT
rfrfrm, 1872 vredl, fueel 3R il & WIF “WIRCTT A1ey IMffraH, 2023 (2023 &I 47) Teg,
foeg 3R o g S |



10008 IoTuF, fedrereT UQer, 09 STHEN), 2026 /19 U, 1947

36. GRT 169 BT WMo JARAFRH o gRT 169 & IT—GRT (2) #, <o ufehar
AT, 1973 PI GRT 345 3R 346" TTeal, sl AR APl & WM R “IRAI ANRS GReM Afl,
2023 (2023 PT 46) DI GRT 384 3IR 385" g, fag 3R 3id W ST |

37. RT 172 &1 HAMEE——T ARAFTH @1 o1 172 ¥, "R gve dfedn, 1860 &
I 9—h" =], sl IR 3fpl & WM R YR I Afdl, 2023 & JIUR 9" e, s
3R i /Y SN |

38. HRT 186 &1 HYMYA.——Hal AMRATIH & T 186 B IU—aRT (3) H, T fra” wreat
& g “IAAFRE BT ORT 135 @ SMEF 991¢ Y Rl & Rag” wres sfaenfud fahy S |

39. §RT 190 & WONEH.— MR o arT 190 H, "R qve AfXdl, 1860
gRT 21 & 3" vegl, forgl &R ofdpl & WM IR =g Afedr 2023 @& €RT 2(28)@ 3ref
vreg, fag 3R 3fd R SIU |

40. STIEI—3 BT URRATIA.——T A A Fel [ ggE—3 & W W Ffaiad
G S, Jqi—

“STIA-3
(©RT 32 <)
UM YT gIRT AT STURTET
e rfafs a1 Gfgar &1 9m JTURTET gRT
1, YRA™T <1 Afedr, 2023 WSy SUBfa BIRT BRI 115
2. RA =T AfEgdl, 2023 UHIOd TR ST IUBIIDING Bl 122(1)
3. WRAT =19 wGfedr, 2023 NEALRSERE] 126
4. YR < Gfedr, 2023 THR UBIOd B W Il BHAT HRE AT | 131
MRS §T BT AN B B foTT Tvs |
5. YRA = Afgdr, 2023 g7 194
6. HRAT < Gfedr, 2023 THAT BT ATHIA AT I BRI | I B | 206
foTT HRIR B ST |
7. IRA =T Sfedn, 2023 AT BT A BT AT T BRIATEl Bl AT | 207
SHD TBTIE BT faROT BT |
8. IR < <fedn, 2023 U AT URISE A SHR BRI, SEfdh ld | 213
AP §RT 98 9 Hx & foy 9@ w9 o
sruferg far |
9. WRAT =19 wGfedr, 2023 e A B ol UIIdpd @l Add dl IR | 214
T W SHR HRAT |
10. IR =T Sfedn, 2023 P TR BWER BT I §7PR HRAT 215
1. | IR = wfEdn, 2023 P PRIAE] H 90 Y AP WD BT | 267
AT STYHEE AT SAD B § faeT |
12. R =g Wiedl, 2023 JUeel BRI A Sitee & folw Heheyof | 271
[T BT HHHOT Bea=T 9T T |
13. WRA I Wfedl, 2023 dAd SA—FA AT AR BT Sd SN | 279

14, YRAY g fdr, 2023 AId A1 AT A9RTeT U H Hhe AT 9w | 285




o193, feHTae U9, 09 SHaR), 2026 /19 Y, 1947 10009
15. | YRR =g Afedn, 2023 AT AT STl UsTef & \Rw H SUemqul | 287
3ITERT |
16 ARG =g |iEdr, 2023 foepies yarel & R H Ul MR | 288
17. | R =g Afgdn, 2023 fefl fFAfor &1 fRM, S|a! T=HT S AT | 290
AT SR & AR H STyl R |
18. | MR =T W6fEA1, 2023 Sg—ST=] @ e H SUETYUl JATeRT 291
19. | YRR =g Afedn, 2023 AT U AMEl H Ald G B | 292
ferg <vs |
20. ARG =g |iEdr, 2023 el wr 3R T 296
21. AR =g |fdn, 2023 MRS =ARIHIT 316 (181R 2)
22, WA = Wedl, 2023 RIS §s TR 317 (1 iR 2)
23. AR =g |fdn, 2023 o 318 (131K 2)
24, WRATY =g ied, 2023 Rfte (FHAr a1 81 1,000 3 & a9 dF | 324 (1 4 5
&l | GED)
25. | YR <Y Gfedn, 2023 Sg—ST=g BT 9 B AT I fABANT BT | 325
grRT RfRe| (1,000 30 & o ) |
26. VRGO =1 fedT, 2023 RIS AR 3R Te—AfaR 329
27. ARAT =g GfEdn, 2023 AIBLT T HH B UDIUT B & M | 352
| AT 39H |
28, R =1 wfgdn, 2023 o AT §RT Al A H daR 355
29. ST AffTH,1880 (1880 PT 13) ORI 22 & @UE (F) (@) AR (@) & oid | aRT 22 &
A dTel IR BT G0 Tyrg (M) B
Ryar |
30. | oy Afqar sifefraE, 1871 Al B SIUBT BT TAUGDH [ARIE BRAT | 24
AT I8 Gl |
31, | oy faer srfefrE, 1871 JRT GRT Y AT Bl 3R AASI~Th FSDI | 26
DI I IEATAT S |
32. | fRame uew feeiR (gEu fww) | el o arre, 99 @ oy eniRd 3
AT, 1952
33 | leoe uew fHRR (gEue fww) | AEGiMe e H O fRRR W awE @ | 4
JARIH, 1952 AT BHRAT |
34. | AEGIE T ARRE, 1867 (1867 | JATER HI W B AT SH dAM AT 9R | 3
BT 2) ARE BH & forg wniRe |
3. | WEue  Td  (Ufers  dfafel ) | JemeR H uiw oM @ forg wmiRa 4
e, 1867 (1867 T 2)
36. weuie  Td (s dafel ) | RRyar @fdadl W Ted T iR ud1 oF @ | 7
rffrm, 1867 (1867 &7 2) forg e |
37. s Td (Ufes dafel ) | 39 I @1 aRT 22, 158 IR 187 @

AT, 1867 (1867 &7 2)

eI STURTeT |




10010

o1, feATael U<el, 09 STFaNI, 2026 /19 UIY, 1947

Sections:

_.
SO B W~

T T R T R T T T R O R T R T R T N N O B N N N I O N N B N R N R e
CPOXNANPELD—O0XTIN RN — 000N RN —

AUTHORITATIVE ENGLISH TEXT

ARRANGEMENT OF SECTIONS

Short title.

Amendment of section 2.
Amendment of section 4.
Amendment of section 5.
Amendment of section 5-B.
Amendment of section 7-A.
Amendment of section 9.
Amendment of section 31.
Amendment of section 32.
Amendment of section 33.
Amendment of section 38.
Amendment of section 39.
Amendment of section 40.
Amendment of section 41.
Amendment of section 60.
Amendment of section 64.
Amendment of section 76.
Amendment of section 99.
Substitution of section 115.
Amendment of section 120.
Insertion of section 121-C.
Amendment of section 122.
Amendment of section 133.
Amendment of section 134.
Amendment of section 142.
Amendment of section 144.
Amendment of section 145.
Substitution of section 151.
Amendment of section 152.
Amendment of section 155.

Amendment of section 158-R.

Amendment of section 160.

Amendment of section 160-A.

Amendment of section 161.
Amendment of section 167.
Amendment of section 169.
Amendment of section 172.
Amendment of section 186.
Amendment of section 190.

ACT, 2025

Substitution of SCHEDULE —II1.

Act No. 1 of 2026

THE HIMACHAL PRADESH PANCHAYATI RAJ (AMENDMENT)



ST, feATeeT U<er, 09 SI-a), 2026 /19 WY, 1947 10011
Act No. 1 of 2026

THE HIMACHAL PRADESH PANCHAYATI RAJ (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2025
(AS ASSENTED TO BY THE GOVERNOR ON 31ST DECEMBER, 2025)
AN
ACT
further to amend the Himachal Pradesh Panchayati Raj Act, 1994 (Act No. 4 of 1994).

BE it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of Himachal Pradesh in the Seventy-sixth Year
of the Republic of India as follows:—

1. Short Title—This Act may be called the Himachal Pradesh Panchayati Raj
(Amendment) Act, 2025.

2. Amendment of Section 2.—In section 2 of the Himachal Pradesh Panchayati Raj Act,
1994 (hereinafter referred to as the “principal Act”),—

(a) in clause (22), for the words, sign and figures “section 2 of the Code of Criminal
Procedure, 1973, the words, sign and figures ‘“section 2 of the Bhartiya Nagarik
Suraksha Sanhita, 2023” (46 of 2023) shall be substituted; and

(b) in clause (35), for the words, sign and figures “section 21 of the Indian Penal
Code, 1860, the words, signs and figures “section 2 (28) of the Bhartiya Nyaya
Sanhita, 2023” (45 of 2023) shall be substituted.

3. Amendment of Section 4.—In section 4 of the principal Act, after sub-section (3), the
following shall be inserted, namely:—

“(4) If any person makes in connection with,—

(a) the preparation, revision or correction of an electoral roll; or
(b) the inclusion or exclusion of any entry in or from an electoral roll,

a statement or declaration in writing which is false and which he either knows or
believes to be false or does not believe to be true, he shall be punished as per section
155.”.

4. Amendment of Section 5.—In section 5 of the principal Act,—
(a) in sub-section (1),

(i) in second proviso,—

(A) after the words “Deputy Commissioner”, the words “or the Director”
shall be inserted;

(B) for the figures “30” and for the words “an extra-ordinary general
meeting”, the words “three” and “a special meeting” shall be
substituted respectively; and

(i1) in third proviso for the word “ thirty”, the word “seven” shall be substituted;



10012 IoTuF, fedrereT UQer, 09 STHEN), 2026 /19 U, 1947
(b) in sub-section (3),—

(i) after the word “general”, the words “or a special” shall be inserted; and

(i1) in the end of the proviso for the sign“.” the sign *“:” shall be substituted and
thereafter the following shall be inserted, namely:—

“Provided further that a special meeting organised for the purpose of
awareness of general public and celebration of any day etc., shall not be
adjourned for want of quorum.”.

5. Amendment of Section 5-B.—In section 5-B of the principal Act, in sub-section (1),
for the figure and words “8th March”, the words “first Sunday of February” shall be substituted.

6. Amendment of Section 7-A.—In section 7-A of the principal Act, in sub-section (3),
for the sign “.” the sign “:” shall be substituted and thereafter the following shall be inserted,
namely:—

“Provided that the Pradhan of the Gram Panchayat should be invited as a special
invitee in the meetings of Up-Gram Sabha and the Pradhan may attend the said
meetings.”.

7. Amendment of Section 9.—In section 9 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), the
words “shall be public and” shall be omitted.

8. Amendment of Section 31.—In section 31 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), for
the words, sign and figures “the Criminal Procedure Code, 1973”, the words, sign and figures “the
Bhartiya Nagarik Suraksha Sanhita, 2023” (46 of 2023) shall be substituted.

9. Amendment of Section 32.—In section 32 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2),—

(a) for the words, sign and figures “section 125 of the Code of Criminal Procedure,
19737, the words, sign and figures ‘“‘section 144 of the Bhartiya Nagarik Suraksha
Sanhita, 2023” (46 of 2023) shall be substituted; and

(b) for the words “five hundred”, the words “one thousand” shall be substituted.

10. Amendment of Section 33.—In section 33 of the principal Act, for the words “not
exceeding one hundred”, the words “which may extend to one thousand” shall be substituted.

11. Amendment of Section 38.—In section 38 of the principal Act,—

(a) in clause (b), for the words and figures “section 379 of the Indian Penal Code”,
the words, signs and figures “section 303(2) of the Bharatiya Nyaya Sanhita ,
2023 (45 of 2023) shall be substituted; and

(b) in clause (c), for the words, sign and figures “sections 109 or 110 of the Code of
Criminal Procedure, 1973 ”, the words, sign and figures “sections 128 or 129 of
the Bhartiya Nagarik Suraksha Sanhita, 2023 (46 of 2023) shall be substituted.

12. Amendment of Section 39.—In section 39 of the principal Act, for the words “two
hundred”, the words “one thousand” shall be substituted.

13. Amendment of Section 40.—In section 40 of the principal Act, for the words, sign
and figures “section 202 of the Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973”, the words, sign and figures
“section 225 of the Bhartiya Nagarik Suraksha Sanhita, 2023 (46 of 2023) shall be substituted.



ST, feATeeT U<er, 09 SI-a), 2026 /19 WY, 1947 10013
14. Amendment of Section 41.—In section 41 of the principal Act,—

(a) in sub-section (1), for the words “two thousand”, the words “twenty five
thousand” shall be substituted; and

(b) in sub-section (2), for the words “five thousand”, the words “fifty thousand” shall
be substituted.

15. Amendment of Section 60.—In section 60 of the principal Act, in sub-section (4), for
the words, signs and figures “the Indian Evidence Act, 1872, the Code of Criminal Procedure,
1973” the words, signs and figures “ the Bhartiya Sakshya Adhiniyam, 2023(47 of 2023),
the Bhartiya Nagarik Suraksha Sanhita, 2023 (46 of 2023), shall be substituted.

16. Amendment of Section 64.—In section 64 of the principal Act,—

(a) 1in sub-section (2), for the words, sign and figures “section 7 of the Code of
Criminal Procedure, 1973” | the words, sign and figures “section 7 of the
Bhartiya Nagarik Suraksha Sanhita, 2023” (46 of 2023) shall be substituted ; and

(b) in sub-section (5), for the words, number, sign and figures “Chapter XXXIII of
the Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973” , the words, number, sign and figures
“Chapter XXXIV of the Bhartiya Nagarik Suraksha Sanhita, 2023” (46 of 2023)
shall be substituted.

17. Amendment of Section 76.—In section 76 of the principal Act, for the words, signs
and figures “section 75 of the Indian Penal Code, 1860 or section 356 or 360 of Code of
Criminal Procedure, 1973 ”, the words, signs and figures “section 13 of the Bhartiya Nyaya
Sanhita, 2023 (45 of 2023) or sections 394 or 401 of the Bhartiya Nagarik Suraksha Sanhita,
2023 (46 of 2023) shall be substituted.

18. Amendment of Section 99.—In section 99 of the principal Act,—

(134

(a) in sub-section (5), for the sign “.”, the sign “ : ” shall be substituted and thereafter
the following shall be inserted, namely:—

“Provided that for making the payment of salary, the amount from the Panchayat
Samiti Fund may be withdrawn under the signature of the Secretary of the
concerned Panchayat Samiti, for which ex-post facto approval shall be obtained
from the House in its immediate next meeting.”; and

(b) in sub-section (6), for the sign “.”, the sign “ : “shall be substituted and thereafter
the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

“Provided that for making the payment of salary, the amount from the Zila
Parishad fund may be withdrawn under the signature of the Secretary of the
concerned Zila Parishad, for which ex-post facto approval shall be obtained from
the House in its immediate next meeting.”.

19. Substitution of Section 115.—For section 115 of the principal Act, the following shall
be substituted, namely:—

“115. Recovery of arrears.—(1) The Secretary of the Panchayat shall take all
necessary steps for the recovery of arrears of any tax, water rate, rent, fee, or any other
sum claimable by the Panchayat from any person, by issuing a notice of recovery to
such person.



10014 IoTuF, fedrereT UQer, 09 STHEN), 2026 /19 U, 1947

(2) The Block Development Officer concerned shall furnish to the Collector the details
of the amount recoverable, alongwith a list of persons from whom such amount is due,
in respect of the Panchayat Samiti and the Gram Panchayat.

(3) The Chief Executive Officer concerned shall furnish to the Collector the details of
the amount recoverable, alongwith a list of persons from whom such amount is due, in
respect of the Zila Parishad.

(4) The amount claimable by a Panchayat may be recovered by the Collector as an
arrear of land revenue:

Provided that the State Government may, by order, appoint any other officer to
exercise the powers of the Collector under the Himachal Pradesh Land Revenue Act,
1953 (6 of 1954) .”.

20. Amendment of Section 120.—In section 120 of the principal Act, after sub-section
(3), the following shall be inserted, namely:—

“(4) If a Panchayat is not constituted due to force-majeure conditions or boycott by
general public or due to some other reasons after the issue of election programme by
the State Election Commission, the term of such Panchayat constituted later on shall
run concurrently with other Panchayats of the State.”.

21. Insertion of Section 121-C.—After section 121-B of the principal Act, following shall
be inserted, namely:—

“121-C. Disqualification for failure to lodge account of election expenses.—If the
authorised officer is satisfied that,—

(a) the candidate has failed to lodge an account of election expenses within the time
and in the manner required by or under this Act; or

(b) the account lodged by the candidate are not in accordance with prescribed format,
and

(c) the candidate has no good reason or justification for the failure mentioned in
clause (a) or (b), above,—

he shall, forward the names of such contesting candidates to the District Election
Officer, who shall by order published in the Gazette, declare such candidates
disqualified for being chosen as, and for being office bearer, of a Panchayat for a
period of three years from the date of publication of the order in the Gazette and
declare the election of the elected office bearer to be void:

Provided that any such candidate may file an appeal to the Divisional Commissioner
within a period of 30 days from the publication of such order and his order shall be
final.”.

22. Amendment of Section 122.—In section 122 of the principal Act,—
(a) in sub-section (1),—

(1) 1in clause (bb), after the words “section 180 of this Act”, the words “unless a
period of six years has elapsed from the date on which the finding of the
authorised officer as to such practice has been given” shall be inserted;



ST, feATeeT U<er, 09 SI-a), 2026 /19 WY, 1947 10015

(i1) in clause (d), after the words “for the time being in force”, the words
“unless a period of six years has elapsed since his conviction” shall be
inserted;

(iii) in clause (e), for the words, sign and figures “section 110 of the Code of
Criminal Procedure, 1973 ”, the words, sign and figures “section 129 of the
Bhartiya Nagarik Suraksha Sanhita, 2023 (46 of 2023) shall be substituted;
and

(iv) the proviso to clause (n) shall be omitted,

(b) after sub-section (1), the following shall be inserted, namely:—

“(1-A) If an Ex-Office bearer is found guilty for loss, misappropriation, waste, or
misapplication of any money or fund or other property of the Panchayat to which
he has been a party, or which has been caused by him by misconduct or gross
negligence of his duties unless a period of six years has elapsed since his
demitting the office, shall be disqualified for being chosen as an office bearer of a
Panchayat.”; and

(c) in sub-section (2), after sign and figure “(1)”, the words, signs, and figure
“or sub-section (1-A)” shall be inserted.

23. Amendment of Section 133.—In section 133 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1),
after the word “Director”, the words “or any other officer authorised by him” shall be inserted.

24. Amendment of Section 134.—In section 134 of the principal Act,—

(a) in sub-section 2, in clause (g), after the words “Zila Parishad”, the words “or the
Director” shall be inserted; and

(b) in sub-section 3, in clause (g), after the words “Zila Parishad”, the words “or the
Director or the State Government” shall be inserted.

25. Amendment of Section 142.—In section 142 of the principal Act,—

(a) in sub-section (1), after the words and sign “office bearer,”, the words and sign
“Ex-office bearer during his tenure in the office” shall be inserted; and

(b) after sub-section (2), the following shall be inserted, namely:—

“(3) The responsibility of concerned regular, contractual, daily wage, outsourced
or other scheme based employees like Junior Engineers, Gram Rojgar Sahayaks,
Technical Assistants, Accountants and other similar workers engaged by the
Panchayats and the Panchayati Raj department shall also be fixed, in case they
fail to perform the duties assigned to them or do not perform such duties with due
diligence or in accordance with the instructions.

26. Amendment of Section 144.—In section 144 of the principal Act, in sub-section 3, in
clause (b), for the words, number signs and figures “Provisions of Chapter VII of the Code of
Criminal Procedure, 1973, the words, signs, letters and figures “provisions of Chapter VII of the
Bhartiya Nagarik Suraksha Sanhita, 2023” (46 of 2023) shall be substituted.

27. Amendment of Section 145.—In section 145 of the principal Act,—



10016

o1, feATael U<el, 09 STFaNI, 2026 /19 UIY, 1947

(a)

(b)

(c)

(d)

in sub-section (1),—
(1) for clause (a), the following shall be substituted, namely:—

“(a) who remained in custody for more than fourteen days on a criminal
charge or otherwise or against whom charges have been framed in any
criminal proceedings under chapter IV, VII, IX, X, XIII, sections 63, 64, 65,
66, 67, 68, 69, 70, 71, 80, 88 to 94, 99 of chapter V, sections 103,104, 107,
108, 109, 141, 146 of chapter VI, sections 310(2) and (3), 311, 312, 316(4)
and (5), 318(4), 326 (g), 331(6) and (8) of Chapter XVII and Chapter XVIII
of the Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 or sections 39 to 59 of Chapter-VI of
the Himachal Pradesh Excise Act, 2011(33 of 2012) or the Protection of
Children from Sexual Offences Act, 2012 (32 of 2012)or the Prevention of
Corruption Act, 1988 (49 of 1988) or any other law for the time being in
force for the prevention of adulteration of food stuff and drugs, suppression
of immoral traffic in women and children and protection of civil rights:

Provided that for suspending any office bearer under this clause there shall
be no requirement to issue show cause notice alongwith chargesheet and any
office bearer, placed under suspension against whom charges have been
framed in any criminal proceedings shall remain under suspension, till the
final decision of the competent court :

Provided further that the suspension of an office bearer placed under
suspension after remaining in custody for more than fourteen days on a
criminal charge or otherwise shall be revoked, if chargesheet is not produced
by the investigating agencies in the competent court within six months from
the date of custody;”; and

(i1) the proviso to sub-section (1) shall be deleted.
for sub-section (2-A), the following shall be substituted, namely:—

“(2-A) No office bearer shall be placed under suspension under clause (c) of sub-
section (1) or sub-section (2) unless he has been given an opportunity of being
heard by issuing a show cause notice alongwith a copy of chargesheet or
preliminary inquiry or inspection or audit report, as the case may be.”;

in sub-section (3), for the words, signs and figures “sub-section (1) or (2)”, the
words, signs and figures “clause (c¢) of sub-section (1) or sub-section (2)” shall be
substituted; and

after sub-section (3), the following shall be inserted, namely:—

“(3-A) In cases, where inquiry under section 146 is not completed within six
months, the officer holding inquiry shall furnish reasons in writing to concerned
authority and further, one time extension for six month may be given.

(3-B) Where the delay is on the part of the elected representative for non-
cooperation in the inquiry in accordance with law, the suspension order shall not
be revoked after expiry of six months and the inquiry officer shall further proceed
for ex-parte inquiry within stipulated period.



ST, feATeeT U<er, 09 SI-a), 2026 /19 WY, 1947 10017

28.

(3-C) The order of revocation of suspension under sub-section (3) of said section
shall not affect the inquiry under section 146 until it is concluded.”; and

(e) in sub-section (4), for the sign “.”, the sign “:” shall be substituted and thereafter
the following shall be inserted, namely:—

“Provided that in case the elected office bearers of a Panchayat are suspended to
the extent that the number of remaining elected office bearers do not fulfill the
quorum required for convening a meeting of the Panchayat, then the State
Government or the authority as may be prescribed, may constitute a committee of
persons alongwith head of such committee on the recommendations of Gram
Sabha concerned, to exercise the powers, perform the duties and discharge the
functions of the Panchayat until the final decision is pending on such suspended
office bearers.”.

Substitution of Section 151.—For section 151 of the principal Act, the following

shall be substituted, namely:—

29.

“151. Penalty for acquisition by a member, office bearer or servant of interest in
contracts.—If a member or office bearer or servant of Panchayat knowingly acquires,
directly or indirectly any personal share or interest in any contract or employment with,
by or on behalf of a Panchayat, he shall be deemed to have committed an offence
under section 202 of the Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 (45 of 2023).

“Explanation.—For the purposes of this section “servant of panchayat” shall include
all the employee who are serving in Panchayats irrespective of appointing authority
not being the Panchayat and irrespective of the source of their remuneration.”.

Amendment of Section 152.—In section 152 of the principal Act, for the words, sign

and figures “section 341 of the Indian Penal Code, 1860 , the words, signs and figures “section
126 (2) of the Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 (45 of 2023) shall be substituted.

30. Amendment of Section 155.—In section 155 of the principal Act, the existing
provision shall be numbered as (1) and thereafter the following shall be inserted, namely:—

31.

“(2) If any person makes in connection with, the inclusion or exclusion of any entry in
or from an electoral roll, a statement or declaration in writing which is false and which
he either knows or believes to be false or does not believe to be true, he shall be
punished with fine of five thousand rupees.”.

Amendment of Section 158-R.—In section 158-R of the principal Act,—

(a) in heading, after the words “distributed on Polling day”, the words “and counting
day” shall be inserted; and

(b) in sub-section (1), after the words “ in that polling area”, the words “and on the
day of counting” shall be inserted.

32. Amendment of Section 160.—In section 160 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1),
at the end for the sign “.” the sign “ : ” shall be substituted and thereafter the following shall be
inserted, namely:—

“Provided that only such person shall be considered for appointment as State Election
Commissioner who has worked for twenty years in a Group-A or Class-I post in the



10018 IoTuF, fedrereT UQer, 09 STHEN), 2026 /19 U, 1947

Central or State Government with experience of conducting elections and there is no
vigilance or departmental case pending against him:

Provided further that the Vigilance Clearance Certificate shall also be obtained before
making appointment.”.

33. Amendment of Section 160-A.—In section 160-A of the principal Act, for the words
“State Government”, wherever occurs the words “District Election Officer” shall be substituted.

34. Amendment of Section 161.—In section 161, in clause (iii), for the word
“Commissioner”, the words “Divisional Commissioner” shall be substituted.

35. Amendment of Section 167.—In section 167 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2),
for the words, sign and figures “Indian Evidence Act, 1872” , the words, sign and figures
“Bhartiya Sakshya Adhiniyam , 2023 (47 of 2023) shall be substituted.

36. Amendment of Section 169.—In section 169 of the principal Act, for the words, sign
and figures “sections 345 and 346 of the Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973 ”, the words, sign and
figures “sections 384 and 385 of the Bhartiya Nagarik Suraksha Sanhita, 2023” (46 of 2023) shall
be substituted.

37. Amendment of Section 172.—In section 172 of the principal Act, for the words,
number, signs and figures “Chapter IX-A the Indian Penal Code, 1860 , the words, number, sign
and figures “Chapter X of the Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023” (45 of 2023) shall be substituted.

38. Amendment of Section 186.—In section 186 of the principal Act, in sub-section (3),
after the words “All rules”, the words “ except the rules framed under section 135(2)”, shall be
inserted.

39. Amendment of Section 190.—In section 190 of the principal Act, for the words, sign
and figure, “the meaning of section 21 of the Indian Penal Code, 1860, the words, signs and
figures “the meaning of section 2(28) of the Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 (45 of 2023) shall be
substituted.

40. Substitution of SCHEDULE III.—For SCHEDULE-III appended to the principle
Act, the following shall be substituted, namely:—

"SCHEDULE-III
(See section 32)

OFFENCES COGNIZABLE BY A GRAM PANCHAYAT

No. Name of Act/Code Offence Section
1 2 3 4
1. | Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 Voluntarily causing hurt 115
2. | Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 Voluntarily causing hurt on provocation 122 (1)
3. | Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 Wrongful restraint 126
4. | Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 Punishment for assault or criminal force otherwise | 131
than on grave provocation.




]IS0, f3AMae Uael, 09 SFa™), 2026 /19 U, 1947 10019
5. | Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 Affray 194
6. | Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 Absconding to avoid service of summons or other | 206
proceedings.
7. | Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 Preventing service of summons or other | 207
proceedings, or preventing publication thereof.
8. | Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 Refusing oath or affirmation when duly required | 213
by a public servant to make it.
9. | Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 Refusing to answer a public servant authorised to | 214
question.
10. | Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 Refusing to sign statement 215
11. | Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 Intentional insult or interruption to public servant | 267
sitting in judicial proceeding.
12. | Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 Negligent act likely to spread insfection of disease | 271
dangerous life.
13. | Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 Fouling the water or public spring or reservoir. 279
14. | Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 Danger of obstruction in public way or line of | 285
navigation.
15. | Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 Negligent conduct with respect to fire or | 287
combustible matter.
16. | Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 Negligent conduct with respect to explosive | 288
substance.
17. | Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 Negligent conduct with respect to pulling down, | 290
repairing as contructing buildings, etc.
18. | Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 Negligent conduct with respect to animal 291
19. | Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 Pubishment for public nuisance in cases not | 292
otherwise provided for.
20. | Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 Obscene acts and songs 296
21. | Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 Criminal breach of trust 316 (1) and
2
22. | Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 Stolen property 317 (1) and
2
23. | Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 Cheating 318 (1) and
@)
24. | Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 Mischief (causing damage to property or loss up to | 324 (1) and
Rs. 1000/-). 5
25. | Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 Mischief by killing or maiming animal (value of | 325
up to Rs. 1000/-).
26. | Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 Criminal trespass and house-trespass 329
27. | Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 Intentional insult with intent to provoke 352
breach of peace.
28. | Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 Misconduct in public by a drunken person 355
29. | The Vaccination Act, 1880 Punishment of offences covered by clauses (a), (b) | 22 except
(Act XIII) of 1880. and (d) of section 22. clause (¢)
30. | The Cattle Trespass | Forcibly opposing the seizure of cattle or re- | 24
Act, 1871. securing the same.
31. | The Cattle Trespass | Causing damage to land or crops or public roads | 26
Act, 1871. by pigs.
32. | The Himachal Pradesh Juveniles | Penalty for selling tobacco to children 3
(Prevention of Smoking) Act, 1952.
33. | The Himachal Pradesh Juveniles | Seizure of tobacco from juveniles in a public place | 4
(Prevention of Smoking) Act, 1952.
34. | The Public Gambling Act, 1867 (II | Penalty for owning or keeping or having charge of | 3
of 1867). gambling house.
35. | The Public Gambling Act, 1867 (II | Penalty for being found in a gamblig house 4

of 1867).




10020 IoTuF, fedrereT UQer, 09 STHEN), 2026 /19 U, 1947

36. | The Public Gambling Act, 1867 (II | Penalty on persons arrested for giving false names | 7
of 1867). and address.
37. | The Public Gambling Act, 1867 (II | Offences under sections 22, 158 and 187 under
of 1867). this Act.”.
fafer femmr

IHAT—2, 8 SR, 2026

H&T: A UAIIMR—3L.(6)—12 / 2020—clol.—HART & KU o IR & AU & s

201 & I UG WfAaal BT JART I_d g HREM (fRAMe Uaer Henes) faeries, 2020 (2020
®1 fAEus AFid 7) B QAP 07—10—2025 B JFAINRT PR IT € A1 fBAMEA uewr &
TRITA - IRA & AMMEE & I°0s 348 & WUS (3) & 379 9ed & U Urs &l JTefu,
feArae geer H gSIRa & @ folt wiitied X e 2| ofa: SWiad faere &1 av 2026 &
JAAFTH F=AH 2 B BU A FUS WP U6 Afled Ioud (3—7Toie) ZHr=d Uer § UahiiRid

fopar <Irar 2

ST ET,

FEIRT / —
(Sto fage fa),
e Al et vd wgaa dfaa (ff) |

2026 T IJEATIH G&TH 2

HREM (RArae yer Haer) s, 2020

1. e 9m iR UR™T |
2. oRT 2 BT AL |
3. oRT 65 BT G |
4. ORI 85 BT HAME |

5 YRT 1069 Pl <MY |

RIS BT HH

6. 2020 @ BATAC UQY AT WP 5 BT FRAT AR ATGRRA |




